
CVE20160089 Wilmington Savings Bank vs Justin Mayer, et al $95,000.00 $63,334.00
Judgment Amount $161,722.21 952 State Route 734 NW
PPN: 06001300001402 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $135,000.00
CVE20160025 PNC Bank, NA vs Gwen J. Furniss, et al $60,000.00 $40,000.00
Judgment Amount $63,737.51 32 Janes Street
PPN: 080-009-0-03-024-00 Jeffersonville, OH  43128
PPN: 080-009-0-03-025-00

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from Sale n/a n/a
CVE20160113 Homebridge Financial Services vs Tonya Brown et al $40,000.00 $26,667.00
Judgment Amount $152,180.96 245 SW Staunton Jasper Rd.
PPN: 010-016-0-00-023-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160
PPN: 010-016-0-00-022-00

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $93,480.00
CVE20150194 Huntington National Bank vs Larry D. Funk, et al $60,000.00 $40,000.00
Judgment Amount $81,467.89 7036 US 62 NE
PPN: 125-005-0-00-011-01 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from Sale n/a n/a

CVE20150328 Carrington Mortgage Services vs David Huff, et al $29,000.00 $19,334.00
Judgment Amount $89,040.21 8109 Greenfield Sabina Road
PPN: 010-020-0-00-047-00 Sabina, OH  45169

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $45,600.00
CVE20160242 Fifth Third Mortgage Company vs Dustin Frazier, et al $15,000.00 $10,000.00
Judgment Amount $47,905.21 710 E. Paint Street
PPN: 211-005-1-00-033-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  No Bid No sale.  To be offered again 02/15/17
CVE20160057 Bayview Loan Servicing, LLC vs Franklin Shoemaker et al $22,000.00 $14,667.00
Judgment Amount $91,094.48 325 Bloomingburg New Holland Rd.
PPN: 190-005-0-02-043-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $31,000.00
CVE20160252 United States of America, USDA vs Amanda Brewer, et al $130,000.00 $86,667.00
Judgment Amount $124,980.55 931 Ghormley Road
PPN: 170-008-0-00-011-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Nosbor Investments, LLC $132,000.00
CVE20160229 The Huntington National Bank vs James M. Seitz, II et al $48,000.00 $32,000.00
Judgment Amount $95,663.47 1214 Washington Avenue
PPN: 214-010-4-00-105-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $47,000.00
CVE20160263 JPMC Specialty Mortgage, LLC vs Robert P. Gordon, et al $49,000.00 $32,667.00
Judgment Amount $116,880.74 394 Zimmerman Road
PPN: 170-010-0-00-024-00 Greenfield, OH  45123

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a
CVE20160193 U.S. Bank NA vs John T. Stritenberger, et al $95,000.00 $63,334.00
Judgment Amount $96,088.72 421 W. East Street
PPN: 213-025-3-00-033-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Fayette County Sheriff's Office 113 East Market Street Washington CH OH 43160

Wednesday February 1, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.

Wednesday January 4, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.



RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20160228 U.S. Bank NA vs Justin Braman, et al $30,000.00 $20,000.00
Judgment Amount $83,276.92 134 Grand Avenue
PPN: 212-015-2-00-044-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  John Stiffler $30,000.00
CVE20090512 Milton Banking Company vs George J. Giammarino, et al $125,000.00 $83,334.00
Judgment Amount $190,504.93 8364 SR 207
PPN: 100-009-0-00-010-01 Mount Sterling, OH  43143

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $120,000.00

CVE20150352 U.S. Bank National Association vs Brian J. Fortier, et al $60,000.00 $40,000.00
Judgment Amount $93,788.05 1271 Bogus Road NE
PPN: 190-013-0-01-007-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to: Plaintiff $56,900.00
CVE20160227 U.S. Bank National Association vs Cheryl D. Remy et al $25,000.00 $16,667.00
Judgment Amount $61,766.36 1132 E. Paint Street
PPN: 211-006-1-00-031-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to: Plaintiff $57,000.00

CVE20160238 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Joey Howard, et al Minimum Amt: $19,722.36
PPN: 160-025-0-03-021-00 101 Biddle Blvd.

Bloomingburg OH   43106
No Bid - No Sale

CVE20160138 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Cathy McDonald, et al Minimum Amt: $20,577.98
PPN: 160-025-0-03-081-00 89 Midland Avenue

Bloomingburg OH   43106
No Bid - No Sale

CVE20160285 The Huntington National Bank vs Sonya Henry et al $35,000.00 $23,334.00
Judgment Amount $59,090.33 5366 Greenfield Sabina Road
PPN: 010-020-0-00-093-08 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $23,334.00
CVE20160263 JPMC Specialty Mortgage, LLC vs Robert P. Gordon et al $49,000.00 $32,667.00
Judgment Amount $116,880.74 394 Zimmerman Road
PPN: 170-010-0-00-024-00 Greenfield, OH  45123

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $60,000.00
CVE20160336 The Huntington National Bank vs Angela Self et al $40,000.00 $26,667.00
Judgment Amount $60,784.96 8127 Main Street
PPN: 040-002-0-01-004-00 Milledgeville OH  43142

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $26,667.00
CVE20160257 Quicken Loans Inc. vs Marvin James Broadus et al $60,000.00 $40,000.00
Judgment Amount $62,379.84 332 E. Paint Street
PPN: 211-004-1-00-037-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $40,000.00

CVE20160259 U.S. Bank NA vs Robert Rinehart, et al $10,000.00 $6,667.00
Judgment Amount $55,955.25 6679 South Alley Street
PPN: 030-002-0-01-067-07 Milledgeville OH  43142
PPN: 030-002-0-01-067-08 (Note:  This is for land only and does not include mobile home)

Original sale date March 8, 2017;   Second sale date March 22, 2017

Wednesday March 8, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.

Wednesday May 10, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.

Wednesday April 12, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.



PPN: 030-002-0-01-067-09
RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a n/a

CVE20170011 Nationstar Mortgage, LLC vs Brant Finley, et al $40,000.00 $26,667.00
Judgment Amount $57,177.68 5 West High Street
PPN: 080-009-0-03-098-02 Jeffersonville, OH  43128

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20150237 U.S. Bank NA vs Sherry A. Cox, et al $35,000.00 $23,334.00
Judgment Amount $29,404.97 1106 S. Main Street
PPN: 213-029-3-00-077-01 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  213 Florence, LLC $24,000.00
CVE20160107 U.S. Bank NA vs Douglas Self, et al $125,000.00 $83,334.00
Judgment Amount $122,939.11 52 Walnut Creek Road
PPN: 170-011-0-00-009-03 Greenfield, OH  45123

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Glenn Keaton Jr. & Cathy Keaton $133,000.00
CVE20160287 Fifth Third Bank, Ohio Banking vs Betty Cornell et al $50,000.00 $33,334.00
Judgment Amount $34,978.21 1430 Lindberg Avenue
PPN: 214-020-4-00-001-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  213 Florence, LLC $44,000.00
CVE20140166 Geauga Savings Bank vs Peter Herdt et al $55,000.00 $36,667.00
Judgment Amount $139,247.37 5937 SW Washington New Martinsburg Road
PPN: 170-002-0-00-010-01 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20170007 The Huntington National Bank vs Pamela Atkinson et al $30,000.00 $20,000.00
Judgment Amount $51,651.49 913 Washington Avenue
PPN: 214-009-4-00-015-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $20,000.00
CVE20160048 The Huntington National Bank vs Shaun McConkey, et al $42,000.00 $28,000.00
Judgment Amount $56,174.77 614 Willabar Drive
PPN: 213-027-3-00-035-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Wesley Hatfield & Stephanie Hatfield $32,000.00

CVE20160239 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Valentino Austin, et al Minimum Amt: $12,440.91
PPN: 160-025-0-03-235-00 47 Main Street

Bloomingburg, OH  43106
No Bid - No Sale

CVE20160296 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Remick Daniel Lee Ramsey, et al Minimum Amt: $4,576.33
PPN: 220-020-0-02-001-00 7107 State Route 753

Washington C.H., OH  43160
No Bid - No Sale

CVE20160296 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Remick Daniel Lee Ramsey, et al Minimum Amt: $5,306.70
PPN: 220-020-0-02-002-00 7123 State Route 753

Washington C.H., OH  43160
No Bid - No Sale

CVE20160332 Bayview Loan Servicing, LLC vs Karen Edenfield, et al $25,000.00 $16,667.00
Judgment Amount $20,202.48 245 Curtis Street
PPN: 190-011-0-05-031-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $16,667.00
CVE20170026 Wells Fargo Bank, NA vs Tyler S. Tackett et al $50,000.00 $33,334.00

Wednesday May 31, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.

Original sale date May 10, 2017; Second sale date May 24, 2017



Judgment Amount $46,687.58 226 West High Street
PPN: 080-009-0-03-637-00 Jeffersonville, OH  43128

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20160317 Wells Fargo Bank, NA vs Daryl Cathell, et al $80,000.00 $53,334.00
Judgment Amount $69,167.36 2336 Robinson Road
PPN: 215-020-0-00-007-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $53,334.00
CVE20150268 Siwell Inc. dba Capital Mortgage vs Clarence Sutton et al $115,000.00 $76,667.00
Judgment Amount $131,227.90 1066 Spring Lake Avenue
PPN: 190-011-0-01-016-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160
PPN: 190-011-0-01-017-01

RESULTS OF SALE: Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20170039 Federal National Mortgage vs Dallas McManes et al $35,000.00 $23,334.00
Judgment Amount $56,538.77 732-734 E. Market Street
PPN: 211-005-1-00-179-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $23,334.00
CVE20160193 U.S. Bank National Association vs John Todd Stritenberger, et al $95,000.00 $63,334.00
Judgment Amount $96,088.72 421 West East Street
PPN: 213-025-3-00-033-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

RESULTS OF SALE: Sold to:  Plaintiff $72,200.00

CVE20160284 U.S. Bank vs Timothy S. McCane, et al $70,000.00 $46,667.00
Judgment Amount $37,529.13 433 Broadway Street
PPN: 214-007-4-00-014-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20160090 U.S. Bank vs Jana Jean Dawes, et al $40,000.00 $26,667.00
Judgment Amount $92,093.57 811 McLean Street
PPN: 214-018-4-00-041-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20170037 Fifth Third Mortgage Co. vs Jerry Todd Ely, et al $65,000.00 $43,334.00
Judgment Amount $98,723.32 3376 Staunton Jasper Road
PPN: 010-021-0-00-149-01 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $43,334.00
CVE20170019 Fifth Third Mortgage Co. vs Tracy L. Reed, et al $20,000.00 $13,334.00
Judgment Amount $68,185.30 314 Forest Street
PPN: 211-004-1-00-072-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $13,334.00

CVE20170091 U.S. Bank vs Timothy E. Hess, et al $110,000.00 $73,334.00
Judgment Amount $141,618.36 403 Waverly Avenue
PPN: 213-027-3-03-027-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:   Branen L. Weade Properties, LLC $87,000.00
CVE20170061 U.S. Bank vs Marcos Miramontez, et al $35,000.00 $23,334.00
Judgment Amount $58,589.77 616 McLean Street
PPN: 214-020-4-00-008-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20160333 Bank of America, NA vs Gilbert Brady, et al $5,000.00 $3,334.00
Judgment Amount $1,037.00 22 E. High Street   
PPN: 080-009-0-03-182-00 Jeffersonville, OH  43128

Wednesday June 21, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.

Wednesday August 2, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.



Sold to: Plaintiff $3,334.00
CVE20160077 U.S. Bank vs Steven R. Stafford, et al $20,000.00 $13,334.00
Judgment Amount $83,789.334 10235 US 62 NE
PPN: 100-012-0-01-059-01 Mount Sterling, OH  43143

Sold to: Robert Caldwell $41,000.00
CVE20160208 U.S. Bank vs Suzette K. Duron-Ackley, et al $55,000.00 $36,667.00
Judgment Amount $52,750.65 5292 State Route 22 SE
PPN: 190-023-0-02-022-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a

CVE20170110 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Manuella Dallmayer, et al Minimum Amt: $43,011.61
PPN: 213-024-3-00-033-00 417 S. Fayette St., Washington C.H., OH   43160     and
PPN: 214-007-4-00-058-00 610 Sycamore St., Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:

CVE20150156 Selene Financial LP vs Richard L. Hart et al $15,000.00 $10,000.00
Judgment Amount $63,404.09 1012 Yeoman Street
PPN: 214-010-4-002-061-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20170101 Fifth Third Mortgage Co. vs Carolyn S. Arnett et al $35,000.00 $23,334.00
Judgment Amount $63,413.17 827 Lakeview Avenue
PPN: 212-020-2-00-138-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20170086 Fifth Third Mortgage Co. vs Rose Mary B. Sherlock et al $32,000.00 $21,334.00
Judgment Amount $48,791.53 716 Yeoman Street
PPN: 214-002-4-00-064-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to: Plaintiff $24,000.00
CVE20170049 Fifth Third Mortgage Co. vs Amanda McFadden et al $120,000.00 $80,000.00
Judgment Amount $122,821.63 3160 Good Hope New Holland Road
PPN: 220-005-0-00-006-03 New Holland, OH  43145

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20150334 Carrington Mortgage Services vs Phyllis Horney, et al set by court $23,439.00
Judgment Amount $16,387.04 414 E. Market Street
PPN: 211-004-1-00-163-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a n/a
CVE20170022 United States of America vs Rodney Bernard, decd et al $45,000.00 $30,000.00
Judgment Amount $83,794.35 941 Gregg Street
PPN: 211-008-1-00-064-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to: Alan Joseph $38,000.00
CVE20160326 US Bank Trust NA vs James Binegar et al $55,000.00 $36,667.00
Judgment Amount $122,530.16 229 Sycamore Street
PPN: 214-001-4-00-006-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to: Plaintiff $41,000.00

CVE20170110 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Washington Property Mgmt, et al Minimum Amt: $12,814.61
PPN: 211-002-1-00-011-00 710 Columbus Avenue, Washington CH OH  43160

Sold to:  No Bid - No Sale

CVE20160115 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Theodore Wesley Cottrell,  et al Minimum Amt: $6,241.22
Original sale date September 13, 2017

Original sale date Sept 6, 2017; Second  sale date September 13, 2017

Original sale date September 6, 2017

Original sale date August 2, 2017 & second sale date August 9, 2017



PPN:  212-016-2-00-011-00 209 N. Hinde Street
Washington CH OH  43160

Sold to: James C. Evans $6,241.22
CVE20160115 (second property) Fayette Co Treasurer vs Theodore Wesley Cottrell,  et al Minimum Amt: $11,480.17
PPN:  010-016-0-00-017-00 5007 US Rte 22 SW

Washington CH OH  43160
Sold to: James C. Evans $11,480.17

CVE20160115 (third property) Fayette Co Treasurer vs Theodore Wesley Cottrell,  et al Minimum Amt: $1,010.69
PPN:  212-016-2-00-063-00 208 W. Temple Street

Washington CH OH  43160
Cancelled from sale n/a

Original Sale Date September 13th, Provisional second sale date September 20, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.
CVE20170090 Fayette Co Treasurer vs Robert Tigner, et al Minimum Amt: $8,263.52
PPN: 170-010-0-01-066-00 9875 Washington New Martinsburg Road
PPN: 170-010-0-01-069-00 Washington CH OH  43160
PPN:  170-010-0-01-065-00 Sold to: No Bid - No Sale

CVE20170139 US Bank NA et al vs Debra L. Hilderbrand et al $15,000.00 $10,000.00
Judgment Amount $87,199.06 615 and 617 East Elm Street
PPN: 214-010-0-00-045-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to: Plaintiff $27,500.00
CVE20170038 JPMorgan Chase Bank vs Rodney Valentine et al $26,000.00 $17,334.00
Judgment Amount $81,261.46 1102 Gregg Street
PPN: 211-009-1-00-038-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a
CVE20160215 Nationstar Mortgage, LLC et al vs Roxanna Mann, et al $18,000.00 $12,000.00
Judgment Amount $42,715.30 412 Eastern Avenue
PPN: 211-012-1-00-112-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to: Plaintiff $38,900.00
CVE20170068 United States of America vs Danny L. Parrish et al $60,000.00 $40,000.00
Judgment Amount $158,632.90 709 High Street
PPN: 213-027-3-00-037-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Cancelled from sale n/a
CVE20160302 US Bank NA et al vs Willa Jean Ater et al $8,000.00 $5,334.00
Judgment Amount $14,880.37 34 Allen Avenue
PPN: 130-016-001-063-00 New Holland, OH  43145

Cancelled from sale n/a
CVE20170101 Fifth Third Mortgage et al vs Carolyn Arnett et al $35,000.00 $23,334.00
Judgment Amount $63,413.17 827 Lakeview Avenue
PPN: 212-020-2-00-138-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to: Plaintiff $35,000.00

CVE20170172 Fifth Third Mortgage et al vs Vanessa L. Pauley, et al $75,000.00 $50,000.00
Judgment Amount $124,784.80 5392 US 22 SE
PPN: 190-023-0-02-018-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $50,000.00
CVE20170030 The Huntington  National Bank vs Kathy L. Barden et al $25,000.00 $16,667.00
Judgment Amount $25,790.94 812 E Temple St
PPN: 211-005-1-00-116-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Wednesday December 6, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.

Wednesday October 11, 2017 at 10:00 a.m.



Sold to:  Plaintiff $16,667.00
CVE20170170 Fifth Third Mortgage et al vs Diane Matticks et al $40,000.00 $26,667.00
Judgment Amount $53,473.67 1023 Washington Avenue
PPN: 214-009-4-00-006-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $26,667.00
CVE20160040 Bayview Loan Servicing, LLC vs Timmy Leisure, et al $45,000.00 $30,000.00
Judgment Amount $85,948.02 446 Leslie Trace
PPN: 190-005-0-03-087-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $66,720.00
CVE20170195 Fifth Third Mortgage et al vs Tammy Shiltz, et al $20,000.00 $13,334.00
Judgment Amount $38,026.44 94 Main Street
PPN: 160-025-0-03-325-00 Bloomingburg, OH  43106

Sold to:  Plaintiff $13,334.00
CVE20170079 Fifth Third Mortgage et al vs Robert Loveall, et al $81,000.00 $54,000.00
Judgment Amount $111,847.04 49 Bogus Rd SE
PPN: 190-022-0-00-035-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $65,000.00
CVE20170242 Planet Home Lending, LLC vs Joshua K. Duffy, et al $45,000.00 $30,000.00
Judgment Amount $76,392.01 5510 Inskeep Rd NW
PPN: 060-019-0-02-010-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $52,111.00
CVE20160067 Bank of America, N.A. vs Richard L. Little, et al $40,000.00 $26,667.00
Judgment Amount $89,684.38 840 Blackstone Street
PPN: 211-032-1-00-016-00 & Washington C.H., OH  43160
PPN: 211-032-1-00-006-00 Cancelled from sale n/a
CVE20170166 The Huntington National Bank vs Lang McKnight, Jr. et al $25,000.00 $16,667.00
Judgment Amount $54,048.56 1213 E. Paint Street
PPN: 211-006-1-00-047-00 Washington C.H., OH  43160

Sold to:  Plaintiff $16,667.00
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